
10/21/09 6:24 AMbehsacutiontotals.txt

Page 1 of 2file:///Users/cmcheechalk/Desktop/specialhorses/behsacutiontotals.txt

1.25   donnalee    holiday stickers
0.00   no bid     stallion breeding
2.00   chief2     jar
0.00   no bid     sweater
1.25   horsesinhaiti   small halter
2.25   marymartin    red fleece horse sweater
0.00   no bid     red cardigan
10.50   marymartin    horse jewelry set
0.00   no bid     silver oval link 
bracelet
5.25   donnalee    silverstretch bracelet
1.01   honeyhendrix   onyx cross
5.25   memphis309    fluerdilis pendant
2.00   jana2u     abstract greensilver set
1.01   chesters mom   horse notebook
0.00   no bid     shoes
0.00   no bid     boat neck sweater
0.00   no bid     green white sweater
10.00   cheif2     bluetan sweater
0.00   no bud     bandw beaded shirt
0.00    no bid     panhandle shirt
6.00   beastieslave   tigerstripe jobs
0.00   no bid     pink shirt
0.00    no bid     wool cahsmere jacket
0.00   no bid     balck coctail dress
0.00   o bid     blue cockatail dress
0.00   no bid     framed rpint
2.00   donnalee    penguin pin'
0.00   no bid     gold dove  
0.00   no bid     sleigh orn
0.00   no bid     ceramic plaqe
0.00   no bid     angel orn
1.01   chester mom    puppy frame
1.50   donnalee    flwered candy tin
0.00   no bid     beaded orn
0.00   no bid     easter tin
0.00   no bid     christmas tin'=
0.00   no bid     beads and charms
1.50   donnalee    bunny basket
2.00   chellebehs    retractable leash
1.50   rapth6     iron on transfer
0.00   no bid     flash cards
0.00   no bid     umbrell base
0.00   no bid     halloween min mig
1.50   donnalee    liz wallet
0.0    no bid     holiday orn
3.00   donnalee    angora hat
1.50   spunky-sproket   black lights
0.00   no bid     bean bag chair
0.00   no bid     snow skis
6.00   sidepasser    horse statue
11.00   brendasau    horse puzzle box
0.00   no bid     bunny figurine
2.00   rberry     canon camera
0.00   no bid     turtle orn
5.00   prudence    tucan jewelry
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0.00   no bid     nola plate
0.00   no bid     nola cup
0.00   no bid     mystery fig
0.00   no bid     bunny fig
3.00   rapth6     tex mem
6.00   Tazzie     horse of a diff color
0.00   no bid     horse fola plate
0.00   no bid     n=bookmark
0.00   no bid     visor
0.00   no bid     globe
15.00   keriandtheflock   how to start a rescue
1.25   Tazzie     babushka doll'
0.00   no bid     air
2.00   wayside     whale
0.00   no bid     pitcher
0.00   no bid     plate
15.00   chief2     moutain ware mug
0.00   no bid     mokey box
0.00   nobid     shell jewlery
0.00   no bid     figurine
1.01   chesters mom   pitcher and plate
0.00   no bid     yo-yo


