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1  16.00 Vandy   racing bundle
2 31.00 prudence  willem model
3 0.00 no bid
4 0.00 no bid
5 12.00 Vandy   jv sing and alex
6 12.00 Vandy   cv sing and alex
7 25.00 Seven Hills  ep sing and alex
8 12.00 Vandy   jl sinf and alex
9 0.00 no bid   rd sing and alex
10 15.00 Vandy   kd sing and alex
11 12.00 Wayside   sc sing and alex
12 0.00 no bid   jc sing and alex
13 12.00 Vandy   ra sing and alex
14 10.50 specialhorses2 secretariat photo
15 15.00 larkbar   affirmed photo
16 18.00 yellow dogs  signed secratariat photo
17 5.00 Vandy   pincay collectors plate
18 0.00 no bid
19 0.00 no bid
20 0.00 no bid
21 0.00 no bid
22 0.00 no bid * duplicate
23 5.01 horsesinhaiti TB racing tshirt
24 0.00 no bid
25 0.00 no bid
26 0.00 no bid
27 0.00 no bid
28 12.00 tressa   TB racing jacket
29 0.00 no bid
30 0.00 no bid
31 10.01 horsesinhaiti horse pin
32 0.00 no bid
33 5.01 rapth6   jpstle photo
34 5.01 rapth6   royal indy photo
35 5.01 rapth6   jostle photo 2
36 5.50 rapth6   fusachi pegasus
37 0.00 no bid
38 5.01 Vandy   preakness glass
39 6.00 chesters mom grand national
40 6.00 equineartworks quadratic print

exceller fund 260.06
00 


