
10/21/09 6:26 AMheatlandauctiontotals.txt

Page 1 of 1file:///Users/cmcheechalk/Desktop/specialhorses/heatlandauctiontotals.txt

55.00  kimber8768   borel photo
51.00  laurierace   borel photo
0.00  no bid
0.00  no bid
6.00  Vandy    oil painting
0.00  no bid
5.00  prudence   dog care book
0.00  no bid
0.00  no bid
0.00  no bid
3.00  bmcgovern   nesting dogs
15.00  sfsandler   bracelet
2.25  donnalee   earrings
3.00  litfiend   horse pin
0.00  no bid
0.00   no bid
3.00  horsesinhaiti  cat figurines
2.50  lancerspat   pewter frame
2.00  lancerspat   pewter frame
100.00  mellsmom   autographed SI
7.00  specialhorses2  carved wood horse
7.00  laurierace   t oconner print 
5.00  equineartworks  ladys first roll
30.00  drcichra   lesson with hilda hick
3.00  gagirl422   alli
45.00  shatter518   full seat kerrits
3.50  marymartin   horse themed bracelet
5.00  beastieslave  dvd lp/sg
3.00  terrybhorse   dvd troy
1.01  honeyhendrix  choker
2.00  jana2u    peacock pearl bracelte
0.00  no bid    jewelry bundle
0.00  no bid    jewelry grab bag
2.50  marymartin   tourmaline bracelet
2.00  litfiend   beads
5.00  prudence   08-bracelet
1.01  horsesinhaiti  pin/broach
0.00  no bid    bracelet
5.00  prudence   green bracelet
1.25  donnalee   grab bag of jewelry
15.00  certifiedgirl  plaid cooler


