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2.25   Memphis309    neer cookbook
5.00   rapth6     calendar
2.25   rovergirl    calender
3.00   rapth6     cookbook
0.00   no bid     cookbook
5.00   rapth6     flymask draft
0.00   no bid     elvis mem
10.00   tjlonerider    dog gift basket
4.00   ponysgt     gift set
6.00   ponysgt     jones NY bag
2.50   equineartworks   horse dvd
37.50   eventer@heart   horse care basket
9.00   talisker    calender
15.00   JV      table linens
2.50   wendi     thelwell watch
2.50   rockridge    puzzle
2.50   rockridge    puzzle
2.50   rockridge    puzzle
8.00   mary,artin    horse pin
4.00   wendi     brass rocking horse
10.00   cindijo     neer cookbook
5.00   ponysgt     mini halter
3.00   ponysgt     photo greeting cards
4.00   talisker    horse greeting cards
5.00   akrogril    horse dishtowel/mat
4.00   ponysgt     carafe
15.00   witchymoods    neer horse print
0.00   no bid     book
3.00   April     riding inst.hdbk
0.00   no bid     book'
6.00   talisker    chosen by a horse
0.00   no bid     book
0.00   no bid     book
3.00   rockridge    horselovers book
0.00   no bid     holdiay dish ware
4.00   tjlonerider    bunny votive
0.00   no bid     brass basket
6.00   mswillie    spode tray
0.00   no bid     photoframe album
5.00   JV      jamaican sauces
5.00   JV      tablecloth
5.50   wolves_echo_64   horsehair set
3.00   ponysgt     flymask pony size
10.00   sunnylaura    flymask draft size
0.00   no bid     cross
3.00   raptch6     puzzle-appies
0.00   no bid     heal depression book
0.00   o bid     hard cover journal
2.00   raptch6     falmac farm book
0.00   no bid     dont sweat book
0.00   no bid     buying time'
0.00   no bid     the hunt ball
0.00   no bid     idiots book
0.00   no nid     when someone u love is 
dpresssed
0.00   no bid     table topper
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0.00   no bid     wool swaeter
0.00   no bid     black velour dress
0.00   no bid     brown suede dress
0.00   no bid     maroon dress
0.00   no bid     plum velour dress
0.00   no bid     RA book
4.00   April     horse/people matching 
book
20.00   beastieslave   canon camera
17.95   heatherquinn   bird clock
75.00   heatherquinn   yingyang halter
95.99   heatherquinn   spurs
16.00   shatter518    elvis doll 3
16.00   equineartworks/sh  elvisdoll 2
16.00   shatter518    elvis doll 1
2.00   horsesinhaiti   horse dream puzzle
2.00   terrybhorse    horse dream puzzle
4.00   wolves_echo_64   horse hair necklace
0.00   no bid     pink flip flops
1.01   chesters mom   gray flip flops
1.50   calysgal24    horse head coin ourse
16.00   heather quinn   sox hat
12.00   hetty     bridle with fringe
35.00   chocomare    leather draft halter
5.00   Tazzie     gray pet carrier
0.00   no bid     marron pet carrier
2.75   horsesinhaiti   500 pc puzzle
5.00   prudence    silver rose earingis
10.00   vannalee1    silver rose jewelry set
2.00   witchymoods    silver rose red set
4.00   calysgal24    tshirt
8.00   pikmybid    western handbag
2.00   ponysgt     noritake set


