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16.00  mjarden    horse statue
0.00  no bid
2.50  donnalee   computer creatures
0.00  no bid    books
10.00  rapth6    two grazing mussles
0.00  no bid    elephant
2.50  rovergirl   parelli button
0.00  no bid    vw bus
0.00  no bud    painted box
0.00  no bid     spurlox
15.00  witchymoods   dressage boots
2.50  donnalee   dreamcatcher
8.00  witchymoods   antique creamer, s&p
5.00  mjarden    conchos
3.00  horsesinhaiti  salt and peppers
0.00  no bid    bobble head kitty
18.00  risk-averse rider digital frame
35.00  mamas_pretty_paints Fun TV
5.50  equineartworks  heart art
5.00  Kaye    stuffed horse
77.00  shatter518   endurance saddle
0.00  no bid    beatles memorablia
60.00  eaquineartworks  ariat boots*
0.00  no bid    suncatcher
0.00  no bid    ornamemts
6.00  equineartworks  tanner's cards
0.00  no bid    wedding dress
0.00  no bid    weddig dress
20.00  risk-averse rider homemade marshmallows
16.00  pikmybid   pet portrait
16.00  pikmybid   pet protrait
25.00  risk-averse rider Dumplin print
450.01  horseinhaiti  trip of a lifetime!
23.00  mjraden    silver bridle
30.01  horsesinhaiti  ariat boots
0.00  no bid    ariat boots
0.00  no bid    vase
0.00   no bid vase
10.00  golden-sinn   1963 gettysburg times
2.00  withcymoods   peruvian earrings
4.00  eaquineartworks  mule earrings
10.00  prudence   sunkissed cookbook
5.00  kodiakstudios  antique glass ware
12.00  candy dish   lancerspat
1.25  Tazzie    spanish wine bottles
5.00  calysgal24   handpainted vase
2.00  witchymoods   plant stand
6.00  Memphis309   rubber boots
3.00  sidepasser   beanie babies
5.00  sidepasser    pewter figurines
50.00  equineartworks  wendys bears*
6.00  equineartworks  fjord suncatcher
0.00  no bid    rat catchers
0.00  no bids    bobble head sea friends
3.00  equineartworks  christmas ornaments
2.00  Tazzie    oriental vase
1.50  Enzobaby   wine glasses
100.00  equineartworks  prom dress
25.00  sidepasser   antique bunny
2.00  maggiefromok  medicien bowl


